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Article 21

judicial districts respectively as heretofore constituted under
the laws of the territory.

Sec. 16. Court seals. Until otherwise provided by law the
seals now in use in the supreme and district courts of this
territory are hereby declared to be the seals of the supreme
and district courts, respectively, of the state.

Sec. 17. Transfer of causes and records from probate
courts to district courts. Whenever this constitution shall
go into effect, records and papers and proceedings of the
probate court in each county, and all causes and matters of
administration and other matters pending therein, shall pass
into the jurisdiction and possession of the district court of
the same county, and the said district court shall proceed to
final decree or judgment order or other determination in the
said several matters and causes, as the said probate court
might have done if this constitution had not been adopted.

Sec. 18. How legislature chosen. Senators and members of
the house of representatives shall be chosen by the qualified
electors of the several senatorial and representative districts
as established in this constitution, until such districts shall
be changed by law, and thereafter by the qualified electors
of the several districts as the same shall be established by
law.
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Sec. 19. Duration of terms of territorial county and
precinct officers. All county and precinct officers who may
be in office at the time of the adoption of this constitution,
shall hold their respective offices for the full time for which
they may have been elected, and until such time as their
successors may be elected and qualified, as may be
provided by law, and the official bonds of all such officers
shall continue in full force and effect as though this
constitution had not been adopted.

Sec. 20. Terms of state officers first elected. Members of
the legislature and all state officers, district and supreme
judges elected at the first election held under this
constitution shall hold their respective offices for the full
term next ensuing such election, in addition to the period
intervening between the date of their qualification and the
commencement of such full term.

Sec. 21. Regular session of legislature following first
session. If the first session of the legislature under this
constitution shall be concluded within twelve months of the
time designated for a regular session
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